

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

# QUOTATION

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

*Terry E. Hicks*

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 1

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

**Terry E. Hicks, Vice President**

Quoted To:
PLAN HOLDERS

Ship To:
BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/ DISTRIBUTION PART 1 1 N MAIN STREET LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
		**** DUE TO THE VOLATILITY OF THE CURRENT RESIN MARKET SOME OR ALL MATERIALS MAY BE REQUOTED AT TIME OF SHIPPING ****		
		**** PVC PIPE PROTECTION: ORDER BY 9-30-21; SHIP BY: 10-29-21 ****		
		**** ITEM #4 ****		
25,865.00	PVC-12DF	12" X 20' L.L. DR18 C900 CL200/PC235 PVC PRESSURE PIPE - GASKETED JOINT	38.08	984,939.20
		**** ITEM #5 ****		
26.00	WIR-12SU	1000' FT REEL #12 SOLID COPPERHEAD #1230B-SF-1000 SUPERFLEX COPPER CLAD WIRE - BLUE JACKET - PE30	133.33	3,466.58
26.00	WIR-WIRE	COPPERHEAD #SCB-01 TWIST ON WIRE CONNECTOR WITH SILICONE FOR DIRECT BURY- (MAX 4 #12 WIRES)	1.33	34.58
26.00	DET-TAPE	3" WIDE X 1000' LONG BLUE DETECTABLE TAPE MARKED "WATERLINE"	33.33	866.58
		**** ITEM #9 **** STEEL CASING PRICE VALID FOR 30 DAYS		
665.00		12" X 20' DR18 C900 RESTRAINED JOINT WITH COUPLINGS/SPLINES	42.29	28,122.85
665.00		20" X 20' L.L. "DOMESTIC" .500 WALL STEEL CASING PIPE	78.30	52,069.50
102.00		12" X 20" CCI POLY BLACK CENTERED AND RESTRAINED CASING SPACER	23.65	2,412.30
4.00		12" X 20" CCI WRAP AROUND RUBBER END SEALS(((AS NEEDED)))	58.30	233.20
4.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" DI MJ LONG PATTERN SOLID SLEEVE	302.21	1,208.84
8.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC** (UNGER)	158.60	1,268.80
		**** ITEM #10 **** STEEL CASING PRICES FIRM FOR 30 DAYS		
365.00		12" X 20' DR18 C900 RESTRAINED JOINT WITH COUPLINGS/SPLINES	42.29	15,435.85
365.00		20" X 20' L.L. "DOMESTIC" .500 WALL STEEL CASING PIPE	78.30	28,579.50
60.00		12" X 20" CCI POLY BLACK CENTERED AND RESTRAINED CASING SPACER	23.65	1,419.00
4.00		12" X 20" CCI WRAP AROUND RUBBER END SEALS(((AS NEEDED)))	58.30	233.20
4.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" DI MJ LONG PATTERN SOLID SLEEVE	302.21	1,208.84
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" DI MJ 90 DEGREE BEND - LESS ACCESSORIES	481.92	963.84
12.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	1,903.20
		**** ITEM #11 ****		
11.00		12" X 3/4" FORD #FC202-1320-CC3-U100 DOUBLE STRAP SADDLE FOR C900 PVC	260.32	2,863.52
11.00	FBA-CORF	3/4" FORD FB1000-3-NL AWWA X CTS-PJ BALL CORP STOP PACK - JOINT	56.31	619.41
11.00	FBJ-BEND	3/4" FORD L44-33-NL CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS COMPRESSION 90 BEND - PACK JOINT -	27.46	302.06

Subtotal	Continued
Sales Tax	Continued
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>Continued</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

# QUOTATION

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 2

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

**Quoted To:**  
PLAN HOLDERS

**Ship To:**  
BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM  
MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/  
DISTRIBUTION PART 1  
1 N MAIN STREET  
LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
11.00	FBG-CURF	3/4" FORD B44-333-NL CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS BALL VALVE CURB STOP	77.06	847.66
55.00	FBJ-INSEF	3/4" FORD #51 CTS STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLYETHYLENE TUBING	1.66	91.30
22.00		2 1/2" "DOMESTIC" 94-E CAST IRON SCREW TYPE CURB BOX - ADJUSTABLE 42" - 60" - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER"	118.47	2,606.34
100.00	STB-POLY	(((AS NEEDED)))CHARTER 3/4" X 100' COIL "CTS" PE4710 CL250 POLYETHYLENE SERVICE TUBING COPPER TUBE SIZE DR9-CTS - BLACK WITH BLUE STRIPES **** ITEM #12 ****	0.29	29.00
15.00	MUE-HYD	5-1/4" X 5'0" BURY MUELLER A423 FIRE HYDRANT - 3 WAY NST - 1-1/2" PENT - OPEN LEFT - 6" MJ SHOE - LESS ACCS - RED - WITH CHAINS	2,428.27	36,424.05
15.00		12" X 6" "DOMESTIC" DI COMPACT MJ X SWIVEL HYDRANT TEE LESS ACCESSORIES	494.81	7,422.15
1.00		(((AS NEEDED))) 6" X 24" "DOMESTIC" DI SWIVEL X SOLID HYDRANT ADAPTER	224.04	224.04
15.00	MUE-VAL	6" MUELLER A-2361-23 R/S MJ ENDS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM - 2" SQ OP NUT - OPEN LEFT - LESS ACCESSORIES	619.37	9,290.55
90.00		3/4" X 3-1/2" "DOMESTIC" COR-BLUE TEE BOLT AND NUT	6.85	616.50
15.00	MJA-06MJ	6" MJ STANDARD GASKET PN: 053989	6.32	94.80
30.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	4,758.00
30.00	ZFPU-06U	6" FORD #UFR1400-DA-6-RB-U **DOMESTIC** RESTRAINT FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - WITH CORE BLUE BOLTS & NUTS	60.32	1,809.60
15.00	VBX-DOMI	5 1/4" #564-S (DOMESTIC - USA) CI SCREW TYPE VALVE BOX - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER" ADJUSTABLE 39" - 50"	170.05	2,550.75
75.00	DIP-06PIP	6" X 20'0" US PIPE CL52 TYTON-JOINT DI PIPE WITH GASKET **** ITEM #13 ****	21.04	1,578.00
45.00		12" X 3/4" FORD #FC202-1320-CC3-U100 DOUBLE STRAP SADDLE FOR C900 PVC	260.32	11,714.40
45.00	FBA-CORF	3/4" FORD FB1000-3-NL AWWA X CTS-PJ BALL CORP STOP PACK - JOINT	56.31	2,533.95
45.00	FBG-CURF	3/4" FORD B44-333-NL CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS BALL VALVE CURB STOP	77.06	3,467.70
45.00		2 1/2" "DOMESTIC" 94-E CAST IRON SCREW TYPE CURB BOX - ADJUSTABLE 42" - 60" - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER"	118.47	5,331.15
45.00	FBF-VH72	5/8 X 3/4 FORD VH72-15W-44-33-NL SINGLE CHECK COPPERSETTER - 3/4" CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS - KEY VALVE INLET X CHECK VALVE OUTLET	165.50	7,447.50
315.00	FBJ-INSEF	3/4" FORD #51 CTS STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLYETHYLENE TUBING	1.66	522.90
45.00	MEB-METI	18" X 36" TUF-COR PLUS DUAL WALL PLASTIC METER BOX WITH NOTCHES	48.75	2,193.75

Subtotal	Continued
Sales Tax	Continued
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>Continued</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

# QUOTATION

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 3

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

Quoted To:
PLAN HOLDERS

Ship To:
BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/ DISTRIBUTION PART 1 1 N MAIN STREET LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
45.00	PWP-PS50	18"-21" ProSource PS500-TLWCL/TBP non-metallic plastic meter box ring and small pentagon bolt Universal Gear top lid with transponder bottom plate	77.75	3,498.75
45.00		5/8 X 3/4 BADGER M25 HRE-LCD(9 DIAL/0.01 GALLON) 10' TWIST TIGHT-W/ORION CELLULAR 4G LTE-M ENDPOINT/10 YR SUBSCRIPTION FULLY LOADED	516.70	23,251.50
45.00	FBJ-COUF	3/4" FORD C44-33-NL CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS COUPLING **** ITEM #14 ****	21.25	956.25
195.00	STB-POLY	CHARTER 3/4" X 100' COIL "CTS" PE4710 CL250 POLYETHYLENE SERVICE TUBING COPPER TUBE SIZE DR9-CTS - BLACK WITH BLUE STRIPES **** ITEM #15 ****	0.29	56.55
1,460.00	STB-POLY	CHARTER 3/4" X 500' COIL "CTS" PE4710 CL250 POLYETHYLENE SERVICE TUBING COPPER TUBE SIZE DR9-CTS - BLACK WITH BLUE STRIPES **** ITEM #16 ****	0.29	423.40
3.00		12" X 1" FORD #FC202-1320-CC4-U100 DOUBLE STRAP SADDLE FOR C900 PVC	260.32	780.96
3.00	FBA-CORF	1" FORD #FB1000-4-G-NL AWWA X CTS-GJ BALL CORP STOP GRIP - JOINT	74.04	222.12
3.00	FBG-CURF	1" FORD B44-444-NL CTS BOTH ENDS BALL VALVE CURB STOP	115.86	347.58
3.00		2 1/2" "DOMESTIC" 94-E CAST IRON SCREW TYPE CURB BOX - ADJUSTABLE 42" - 60" - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER"	118.47	355.41
3.00	FBF-VH74	1" FORD VH74-15W-44-44-NL 1" SINGLE CHECK COPPERSETTER - KEY VALVE INLET X CHECK VALVE OUTLET - 1" CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS	275.03	825.09
21.00	FBJ-INSEF	1" FORD #52 CTS STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLYETHYLENE TUBING	1.76	36.96
3.00	MEB-METI	18" X 36" TUF-COR PLUS DUAL WALL PLASTIC METER BOX WITH NOTCHES	48.75	146.25
3.00	PWP-PS50	18"-21" ProSource PS500-TLWCL/TBP non-metallic plastic meter box ring and small pentagon bolt Universal Gear top lid with transponder bottom plate	77.75	233.25
3.00		1" BADGER M70 HRE-LCD(9 DIAL/0.01 GALLON) 10' TWIST TIGHT-W/ORION CELLULAR 4G LTE-M ENDPOINT/10 YR SUBSCRIPTION FULLY LOADED	661.90	1,985.70
3.00	FBJ-COUF	1" FORD C44-44-NL CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS COMPRESSION COUPLING **** ITEM #17 ****	24.31	72.93
10.00	STB-POLY	CHARTER 1" X 100' COIL "CTS" PE4710 CL250 POLYETHYLENE SERVICE TUBING - COPPER TUBE SIZE DR9-CTS - BLACK WITH BLUE STRIPES **** ITEM # 18 ****	0.48	4.80
55.00	STB-POLY	CHARTER 1" X 100' COIL "CTS" PE4710 CL250 POLYETHYLENE SERVICE TUBING - COPPER TUBE SIZE DR9-CTS - BLACK WITH BLUE STRIPES	0.48	26.40

Subtotal	Continued
Sales Tax	Continued
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>Continued</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

# QUOTATION

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 4

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

**Quoted To:**  
PLAN HOLDERS

**Ship To:**  
BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM  
MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/  
DISTRIBUTION PART 1  
1 N MAIN STREET  
LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
		*** ITEM #19 ***		
1.00		12" X 1 1/2" FORD #FC202-1320-CC6-U100 DOUBLE STRAP SADDLE FOR C900 PVC	292.98	292.98
1.00	FBA-COR1	1 1/2" FORD# FB1000-6-NL AWWA X CTS-PJ COMP BALL CORP STOP	165.92	165.92
1.00	FBG-CUR1	1 1/2" B44-866-NL CTS-PJ COMP BOTH ENDS BALL VALVE CURB STOP	277.23	277.23
1.00		2 1/2" "DOMESTIC" 94-E CAST IRON SCREW TYPE CURB BOX - ADJUSTABLE 42" - 60" - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER"	118.47	118.47
1.00	ZCBX-DO1	***DOMESTIC*** CURB BOX ENLARGED BASE FOR 1 1/2" & 2" CURB STOPS	20.15	20.15
1.00	FBF-CUST	2" FORD VBH77-15B-11-77-NL CUSTOM SETTER BALL VALVE INLET X CHECK VALVE OUTLET 2" FIPT BOTH ENDS	1,209.23	1,209.23
2.00	FBJ-ADAP	1 1/2" FORD C84-66-NL MIPT X CTS-PJ COMPRESSION ADAPTER	56.60	113.20
9.00	FBJ-INSE1	1 1/2" FORD #54 CTS STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLYETHYLENE TUBING PJ + GJ	2.43	21.87
2.00	BFI-BUSH1	2" X 1 1/2" #310-496NL BRASS HEX BUSHING MIPT X FIPT	46.70	93.40
1.00	MEB-3636	36" X 36" FABRICATED METER BOX	256.58	256.58
1.00	FBD-MON1	36" FORD FL-36 MONITOR COVER FLANGE ONLY FOR 36" ID TILE	380.33	380.33
1.00	FBD-MON1	20" FORD PR MONITOR COVER RING ONLY - RECESSED - 6" IN HEIGHT	152.11	152.11
1.00	MBC-MON1	21.25" PWBLKWATtdO POLYMER MONITOR COVER WITH BRONZE SMALL PENTAGON BOLT - POLYMER WORM GEAR; BLACK WITH WATER LETTERING - THREADED FOR ORION - SOLID	104.59	104.59
1.00		1 1/2" BADGER M120 HRE-LCD(9 DIAL/0.01 GALLON) 10' TWIST TIGHT-W/ORION CELLULAR 4G LTE-M ENDPOINT/10 YR SUBSCRIPTION FULLY LOADED	994.65	994.65
1.00	FBJ-COUF	1 1/2" FORD C44-66-NL CTS BOTH ENDS COMPRESSION COUPLING - PACK JOINT -	81.33	81.33
		**** ITEM #20 ****		
10.00	STB-POLY	CHARTER 1 1/2" X 100' COIL "CTS" PE4710 CL250 POLYETHYLENE SERVICE TUBING - COPPER TUBE SIZE DR9-CTS - BLACK WITH BLUE STRIPES	0.99	9.90
		**** ITEM 21 ****		
1.00	ZMJC-DO1	**DOMESTIC** 12" x 12" DI MJ TEE - LESS ACCESSORIES	619.72	619.72
1.00		**DOMESTIC** 12" x 6" UFCO DOMESTIC SEB REDUCER	218.39	218.39
1.00	ZMJC-DO1	****DOMESTIC*** 6" DI MJ LP SOLID SLEEVE - LESS ACCESSORIES	115.24	115.24
1.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD# UFR1400-DA-12-RB-U WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE * DOMESTIC* - W/COR BLUE BOLTS AND NUTS	145.66	145.66
3.00	ZFPU-06U	6" FORD METER BOX #UFR1500-CA-6-RB-U **DOMESTIC** RESTRAINT FOR C900 PVC PIPE - WITH CORE BLUE BOLTS & NUTS	68.68	206.04
2.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/	158.60	317.20

Subtotal	Continued
Sales Tax	Continued
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>Continued</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

# QUOTATION

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 5

Quoted To:
PLAN HOLDERS

Ship To:
BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/ DISTRIBUTION PART 1 1 N MAIN STREET LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
		COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC** **** ITEM #22 ****		
5.00	PVC-06DF	6" X 20' L.L. DR18 CL235 C900 PVC PRESSURE PIPE - GASKETED JOINT **** ITEM 23 ****	12.83	64.15
20.00	MUE-VALV	12" MUELLER A-2361-23 MJ ENDS R/S NRS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM- 2" SQ OP NUT ** LESS ACCESSORIES ** OPEN LEFT	1,946.21	38,924.20
40.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	6,344.00
20.00	VBX-DOMI	5 1/4" #564-S (DOMESTIC - USA) CI SCREW TYPE VALVE BOX - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER" ADJUSTABLE 39" - 50" **** ITEM #24 ****	170.05	3,401.00
8.00	ZMJC-DOI	***DOMESTIC*** 12" DI MJ 90 DEGREE BEND - LESS ACCESSORIES	481.92	3,855.36
16.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	2,537.60
16.00		12" UFR1350-C-12-RB-U "DOMESTIC" BELL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR C900 PVC **** ITEM #25 ****	229.64	3,674.24
25.00	ZMJC-DOI	***DOMESTIC*** 12" DI MJ 45 BEND LESS ACCESSORIES	382.79	9,569.75
50.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	7,930.00
50.00		12" UFR1350-C-12-RB-U "DOMESTIC" BELL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR C900 PVC **** ITEM #26 ****	229.64	11,482.00
2.00	MUE-VALV	12" MUELLER A-2361-23 MJ ENDS R/S NRS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM- 2" SQ OP NUT ** LESS ACCESSORIES ** OPEN LEFT	1,946.21	3,892.42
2.00	VBX-DOMI	5 1/4" #564-S (DOMESTIC - USA) CI SCREW TYPE VALVE BOX - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER" ADJUSTABLE 39" - 50"	170.05	340.10
2.00		12" X 3/4" FORD #FC202-1320-CC3-U100 DOUBLE STRAP SADDLE FOR C900 PVC	260.32	520.64
2.00	FBA-CORI	3/4" FORD FB1000-3-NL AWWA X CTS-PJ BALL CORP STOP PACK - JOINT	56.31	112.62
4.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	634.40
2.00	FBJ-BEND	3/4" FORD L44-33-NL CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS COMPRESSION 90 BEND - PACK JOINT -	27.46	54.92
1.00	FBF-VH72	5/8 X 3/4 FORD VH72-15W-44-33-NL SINGLE CHECK COPPERSETTER - 3/4" CTS-PJ BOTH ENDS - KEY VALVE INLET X CHECK VALVE OUTLET	165.50	165.50

Subtotal	Continued
Sales Tax	Continued
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>Continued</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

# QUOTATION

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 6

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

Quoted To:
PLAN HOLDERS

Ship To:
BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/ DISTRIBUTION PART 1 1 N MAIN STREET LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
1.00	MEB-MET1	18" X 36" TUF-COR PLUS DUAL WALL PLASTIC METER BOX WITH NOTCHES	48.75	48.75
1.00	PWP-PS50	18"-21" ProSource PS500-TLWCL/TBP non-metallic plastic meter box ring and small pentagon bolt Universal Gear top lid with transponder bottom plate	77.75	77.75
8.00	FBJ-INSEF	3/4" FORD #51 CTS STAINLESS STEEL INSERT FOR POLYETHYLENE TUBING	1.66	13.28
1.00		5/8 X 3/4 BADGER M25 HRE-LCD(9 DIAL/0.01 GALLON) 10' TWIST TIGHT-W/ORION CELLULAR 4G LTE-M ENDPOINT/10 YR SUBSCRIPTION FULLY LOADED **** ITEM #27 ****	516.70	516.70
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" x 12" DI MJ TEE - LESS ACCESSORIES	619.72	1,239.44
1.00		12" X 6" "DOMESTIC" DI COMPACT PE X MJ SEB REDUCER LESS ACCESSORIES	218.39	218.39
1.00	ZMJC-DOI	** DOMESTIC** 6" DI MJ SOLID CAP- LESS ACCESSORIES	52.38	52.38
1.00	ZMJC-DOI	12" DI MJ SOLID CAP - LESS ACCESSORIES **DOMESTIC**	153.12	153.12
5.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	793.00
2.00	ZFPU-06U	6" FORD METER BOX #UFR1500-CA-6-RB-U **DOMESTIC** RESTRAINT FOR C900 PVC PIPE - WITH CORE BLUE BOLTS & NUTS	68.68	137.36
1.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD# UFR1400-DA-12-RB-U WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE * DOMESTIC* - W/COR BLUE BOLTS AND NUTS **** ITEM #28 ****	145.66	145.66
1.00	FBA-TAPS	12" X 12" FORD FTSS-1 350-12-U100 DI ALL STAINLESS TAPPING SLEEVE WITH REMOVABLE BOLTS - CARBON STEEL FLANGE RANGE - (13.20 - 13.50)	2,742.95	2,742.95
1.00	MUE-TAP\	12" MUELLER #T-2361-19 FLANGE X MJ TAPPING VALVE W/ STAINLESS STEEL TRIM - *LESS* MJ ACCESSORIES - OPEN LEFT	3,004.63	3,004.63
1.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	158.60
1.00	VBX-DOMI	5 1/4" #564-S (DOMESTIC - USA) CI SCREW TYPE VALVE BOX - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER" ADJUSTABLE 39" - 50" **** ITEM #31 ****	170.05	170.05
1.00		MCI MAG METER VAULT COMPLETE W/HATCH (((NO BID)))		
3.00	MUE-VALV	12" MUELLER A-2361-23 MJ ENDS R/S NRS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM- 2" SQ OP NUT ** LESS ACCESSORIES ** OPEN LEFT	1,946.21	5,838.63
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" DI MJ 90 DEGREE BEND - LESS ACCESSORIES	481.92	963.84
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" x 12" DI MJ TEE - LESS ACCESSORIES	619.72	1,239.44

Subtotal	Continued
Sales Tax	Continued
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>Continued</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

# QUOTATION

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 7

Quoted To:
PLAN HOLDERS

Ship To:
BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/ DISTRIBUTION PART 1 1 N MAIN STREET LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
2.00		12 X 10 "DOMESTIC" DI COMPACT PE X MJ SEB REDUCER LESS ACCESSORIES	228.87	457.74
3.00	VBX-DOMI	5 1/4" #564-S (DOMESTIC - USA) CI SCREW TYPE VALVE BOX - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER" ADJUSTABLE 39" - 50"	170.05	510.15
2.00		10" X 6' "DOMESTIC" FLANGE X PE FAB PIPE C/L, T/C	1,022.88	2,045.76
1.00		10" BADGER MODEL M2000 MAG METER PTFE LINER - #150LB FLANGES WITH STAINLESS GROUND RINGS; 100' WIRED NEMA 6P REMOTE -25' TT/CELLULAR ENDPOINT/10 YR FULLY LOAD	8,278.45	8,278.45
14.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	2,220.40
2.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD# UFR1400-DA-12-RB-U WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE * DOMESTIC* - W/COR BLUE BOLTS AND NUTS	145.66	291.32
2.00		10" FORD UFR1400-DA-10-RB-U "DOMESTIC" WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK **WITH COR-BLUE BOLT & NUTS** FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE	112.12	224.24
2.00		10" "DOMESTIC" FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT WITH 1/8" RED RUBBER RING GASKET **** ITEM #32 ****	119.88	239.76
1.00		STATE ROUTE 56 MAG METER VAULT COMPLETE W/HATCH ((NO BID)))		
3.00	MUE-VALV	12" MUELLER A-2361-23 MJ ENDS R/S NRS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM- 2" SQ OP NUT ** LESS ACCESSORIES ** OPEN LEFT	1,946.21	5,838.63
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" DI MJ 90 DEGREE BEND - LESS ACCESSORIES	481.92	963.84
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" x 12" DI MJ TEE - LESS ACCESSORIES	619.72	1,239.44
2.00		12 X 10 "DOMESTIC" DI COMPACT PE X MJ SEB REDUCER LESS ACCESSORIES	228.87	457.74
3.00	VBX-DOMI	5 1/4" #564-S (DOMESTIC - USA) CI SCREW TYPE VALVE BOX - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER" ADJUSTABLE 39" - 50"	170.05	510.15
2.00		10" X 6' "DOMESTIC" FLANGE X PE FAB PIPE C/L, T/C	1,022.88	2,045.76
1.00		10" BADGER MODEL M2000 MAG METER PTFE LINER - #150LB FLANGES WITH STAINLESS GROUND RINGS; 100' WIRED NEMA 6P REMOTE -25' TT/CELLULAR ENDPOINT/10 YR FULLY LOAD	8,278.45	8,278.45
14.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	2,220.40
2.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD# UFR1400-DA-12-RB-U WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE * DOMESTIC* - W/COR BLUE BOLTS AND NUTS	145.66	291.32
2.00		10" FORD UFR1400-DA-10-RB-U "DOMESTIC" WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY	112.12	224.24

Subtotal	Continued
Sales Tax	Continued
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>Continued</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

# QUOTATION

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 8

### Quoted To:

PLAN HOLDERS

### Ship To:

BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM  
MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/  
DISTRIBUTION PART 1  
1 N MAIN STREET  
LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
2.00		PACK **WITH COR-BLUE BOLT & NUTS** FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE 10" "DOMESTIC" FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT WITH 1/8" RED RUBBER RING GASKET *** ITEM #33 ***	119.88	239.76
1.00		LONDON INTERCONNECT PRV & METER VAULT W/HATCH (((NO BID)))		
1.00	FBA-TAPS	12" X 12" FORD FTSS-1350-12-U100 DI ALL STAINLESS TAPPING SLEEVE WITH REMOVABLE BOLTS - CARBON STEEL FLANGE RANGE - (13.20 - 13.50)	2,742.95	2,742.95
1.00	MUE-TAP\	12" MUELLER #T-2361-19 FLANGE X MJ TAPPING VALVE W/ STAINLESS STEEL TRIM - *LESS* MJ ACCESSORIES - OPEN LEFT	3,004.63	3,004.63
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	***DOMESTIC*** 12" DI MJ 90 DEGREE BEND - LESS ACCESSORIES	481.92	963.84
2.00		12" X 6" "DOMESTIC" DI COMPACT PE X MJ SEB REDUCER LESS ACCESSORIES	218.39	436.78
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	***DOMESTIC*** 6" x 6" DI MJ TEE - LESS ACCESSORIES	189.38	378.76
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	***DOMESTIC*** 6" DI MJ 90 DEGREE BEND - LESS ACCESSORIES	131.36	262.72
2.00	MUE-VAL\	6" MUELLER A-2361-23 R/S MJ ENDS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM - 2" SQ OP NUT - OPEN LEFT - LESS ACCESSORIES	619.37	1,238.74
1.00		6" X 6" "DOMESTIC" FABRICATED FLANGE X PLAIN END DI PIPE C/L, T/C	534.24	534.24
3.00	VBX-DOMI	5 1/4" #564-S (DOMESTIC - USA) CI SCREW TYPE VALVE BOX - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER" ADJUSTABLE 39" - 50"	170.05	510.15
1.00	MUE-VAL\	6" MUELLER A-2361-6 NRS FLANGED ENDS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM - WITH HANDWHEEL - OPEN LEFT	660.81	660.81
1.00		6" CLA-VAL MODEL #133-AWBCSY, 150# FLG, (2) PRESSURE GAUGES - (2) PRESSURE TRANSMITTERS, POSITION TRANS. & VALVE CONTROL PANEL VC22D (AIS COMP.)	17,451.77	17,451.77
1.00		CLA-VAL FACTORY START UP FOR BOTH VALVES ( 1-DAY)	1,400.00	1,400.00
1.00		6" X 5" "DOMESTIC" DIP SPOOL PIECE FLANGE X FLANGE C/L, T/C	686.40	686.40
1.00		6" BADGER MODEL M2000 MAG METER PTFE LINER - #150LB FLANGES WITH STAINLESS GROUND RINGS; 100' WIRED NEMA 6P REMOTE -25' TT-CELL ENDPOINT/10 YR FULLY LOADED	4,937.20	4,937.20
5.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	793.00
2.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD# UFR1400-DA-12-RB-U WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE * DOMESTIC* - W/COR BLUE BOLTS AND NUTS	145.66	291.32
16.00	ZFPU-06U	6" FORD #UFR1400-DA-6-RB-U **DOMESTIC** RESTRAINT FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - WITH CORE BLUE BOLTS & NUTS	60.32	965.12
10.00		6" "DOMESTIC" FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT WITH 1/8" RED RUBBER RING GASKET	59.79	597.90

Subtotal	Continued
Sales Tax	Continued
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>Continued</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.

# Buckeye State Pipe & Supply Co., Inc.

# QUOTATION

14680 Pleasant Valley Road  
Chillicothe, OH 45601

Quote Number: 35302  
Quote Date: Aug 27, 2021  
Page: 9

Voice: 740-772-5400  
Fax: 740-772-5402

**Quoted To:**

PLAN HOLDERS

**Ship To:**

BID DATE: 8-31-21 @ 2 PM  
MADISON COUNTY WATER SYSTEM/  
DISTRIBUTION PART 1  
1 N MAIN STREET  
LONDON, OH 43140

Customer ID	Good Thru	Payment Terms	Sales Rep
QUOTE	9/26/21	Net 30 Days	

Quantity	Item	Description	Unit Price	Amount
		**** ITEM #34 ****		
1.00		US 40 PRV VAULT COMPLETE W/HATCH ((NO BID)))		
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	**DOMESTIC** 12" x 12" DI MJ TEE - LESS ACCESSORIES	619.72	1,239.44
1.00	MUE-VAL	12" MUELLER A-2361-23 MJ ENDS R/S NRS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM- 2" SQ OP NUT ** LESS ACCESSORIES ** OPEN LEFT	1,946.21	1,946.21
2.00	ZMJC-DOI	***DOMESTIC*** 12" DI MJ 90 DEGREE BEND - LESS ACCESSORIES	481.92	963.84
2.00		12" X 6" "DOMESTIC" DI COMPACT PE X PE REDUCER	225.65	451.30
2.00	MUE-VAL	6" MUELLER A-2361-23 R/S MJ ENDS GATE VALVE- WITH STAINLESS STEEL TRIM - 2" SQ OP NUT - OPEN LEFT - LESS ACCESSORIES	619.37	1,238.74
3.00	VBX-DOMI	5 1/4" #564-S (DOMESTIC - USA) CI SCREW TYPE VALVE BOX - WITH COVER MARKED "WATER" ADJUSTABLE 39" - 50"	170.05	510.15
1.00		6" CLA-VAL MODEL #93-01BYCS, 150# FLG., SOLENOID OPERATED OPEN/CLOSE VALVE W/ OPENING AND CLOSING SPEED CONTROLS, (2) PRESSURE GAUGES AND PRESSURE TRANSMITTER	8,225.88	8,225.88
2.00		6" X 6" "DOMESTIC" FABRICATED FLANGE X PLAIN END DI PIPE C/L, T/C	534.24	1,068.48
12.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD UFR1500-CA-12-RB-U CIRCLE-LOCK RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK W/ COR-BLUE BOLTS & NUTS FOR C900 PVC PIPE **DOMESTIC**	158.60	1,903.20
2.00	ZFPU-12U	12" FORD# UFR1400-DA-12-RB-U WEDGE ACTION RETAINER GLAND ACCESSORY PACK FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE * DOMESTIC* - W/COR BLUE BOLTS AND NUTS	145.66	291.32
4.00	ZFPU-06U	6" FORD #UFR1400-DA-6-RB-U **DOMESTIC** RESTRAINT FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - WITH CORE BLUE BOLTS & NUTS	60.32	241.28
2.00		6" "DOMESTIC" FLANGE ACCESSORY KIT WITH 1/8" RED RUBBER RING GASKET	59.79	119.58

Subtotal	1,472,493.20
Sales Tax	
<b>TOTAL</b>	<b>1,472,493.20</b>

THIS QUOTATION IS OUR INTERPRETATION OF THE PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS AND IS NOT GUARANTEED. WE ARE NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR DELAYS BY REASON OF STRIKES, ACCIDENTS, OR CAUSES BEYOND OUR CONTROL. THE QUOTED PRICES ARE BASED UPON RECEIPT OF THE TOTAL JOB QUANTITY; ARE FOR IMMEDIATE SHIPMENT ONLY; AND ARE SUBJECT TO CREDIT APPROVAL. FUTURE SHIPMENTS ARE SUBJECT TO PRICE IN EFFECT AT TIME OF SHIPMENT. ALL SALES ARE F.O.B. SHIPPING.